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Student's Name:

Class: 11.G.4I

English: IELTS
Teacher's name(s): Paul, Joseph Caulfield

Semester Grades Exam Grades Reported Grades

A*Semester 2

Semester 1 A*

A*

A*

End Of Year Final Grade A*

Xuân Khôi has shown an outstanding determination to succeed and exhibited a mature approach to his studies. He is able to
recognise particular points of information conveyed in a text. He is able to present a clear, relevant, well-organised argument
and give evidence or examples to support his ideas. He is able to listen for concrete facts - such as places names, prices and
times - given in a listening text. He is able to express and justify opinions on a particular topic. Xuân Khôi should work to
complete all the questions and tasks on an examination paper to the best of his ability.

Maths
Teacher's name(s): Ramesh, Kumar Singh ; David, Cabigas Sagarino

Semester Grades
Teacher Assessments

(TA Grades)
Exam Grades Reported Grades

A* A*Semester 2

Semester 1 A* A* A*

End Of Year Final Grade A*

Xuân Khôi clearly loves Mathematics and grasps new concepts with ease. He always works hard in lessons and strives to
achieve or exceed his potential. Excellent work! Classwork and test results indicate that Xuân Khôi is making excellent
progress in his studies. Grade 11 have now finished their AS subjects of Pure Mathematics 1 and Mechanics and should now
use the time to consolidate their learning and to prepare for Grade 12, which would include Pure Mathematics 3 and Probability
and Statistics 1.



Business Studies
Teacher's name(s): Reena, Rakesh Nathani

Semester Grades
Teacher Assessments

(TA Grades)
Exam Grades Reported Grades

A* A*Semester 2

Semester 1 A A A

End Of Year Final Grade A*

Xuân Khôi behaves exceptionally well in Business and contributes greatly to class discussion, supporting a pleasant learning
environment. Xuân Khôi is a conscientious member of the class who has shown a keen interest in Business. He has shown to
be hard-working and dedicated to the course. Xuân Khôi has completed all assessments on time to a strong standard to
support his studies. Xuân Khôi is able to use case studies and supporting data with confidence to a consistently high standard.
Xuân Khôi has studied hard throughout the Finance and Accounting Unit of the course and should be confident in his abilities.
He has also shown the need for improvement of his evaluation skills.

Chemistry
Teacher's name(s): Basaveshwariah, Krishnan Sivaraj

Semester Grades
Teacher Assessments

(TA Grades)
Exam Grades Reported Grades

A* A*Semester 2

Semester 1 A* A* A*

End Of Year Final Grade A*

Xuân Khôi is a motivated student who is keen to complete all tasks to the best of his ability and makes an excellent contribution
to the class. Xuân Khôi has done especially well in the organic chemistry topic. Xuân Khôi has demonstrated outstanding
subject knowledge this semester as evidenced by the quality of his classwork, homework and test results. I commend him on
this and the commitment he has shown. Xuân Khôi has demonstrated the ability to plan an experiment. This has been an
excellent semester for Xuân Khôi. Well done and keep up the excellent work.



Physics
Teacher's name(s): Aidan, Francis Williams

Semester Grades
Teacher Assessments

(TA Grades)
Exam Grades Reported Grades

A* A*Semester 2

Semester 1 A* A* A*

End Of Year Final Grade A*

Xuân Khôi is a motivated student who is keen to complete all tasks to the best of his ability. Xuân Khôi demonstrates a passion
for scientific thinking and inquiry and has a positive impact on the learning environment. Xuân Khôi has done especially well in
the electric current topic and Kirchhoff's laws topic. Xuân Khôi has demonstrated outstanding subject knowledge this semester
as evidenced by the quality of his test results. Xuân Khôi has demonstrated the ability to plan an experiment. Xuân Khôi has
made outstanding progress this year and should be proud of this achievement. Well done Xuân Khôi and please keep it up. I
commend him on this and the commitment he has shown to self-studying this A-Level with guidance from his teachers.

Physical Education
Teacher's name(s): Tony, French

Semester 2 Rank

Semester 1 Rank
Teacher Assessment (TA)

Meeting Expectations

Meeting Expectations

End Of Year Final Grade Meeting Expectations

Xuân Khôi has maintained his excellent start to the school year in Physical Education. During the leadership and coaching unit
he has made excellent progress. Xuân Khôi clearly understands what makes a good leader. He consistently demonstrates
exceptional leadership skills in class. He can comprehensively evaluate and reflect on his performance in leadership and
coaching. He can identify clear ways to improve performance. During the healthy bodies unit Xuân Khôi has made excellent
progress. He has a comprehensive understanding of the physiological benefits of a warm-up before exercise. Xuân Khôi has
made excellent progress during the Aquatics unit. He can comfortably and consistently demonstrate the breathing technique
for a range of swimming strokes. Next semester, Xuân Khôi should focus on developing his motor skills through regular
physical activity outside of class.



French
Teacher's name(s): Elise, Piron

Semester Grades
Teacher Assessments

(TA Grades)
Exam Grades Reported Grades

A* A* A*Semester 2

Semester 1 A* A* A*

End Of Year Final Grade A*

Xuân Khôi is an absolute pleasure to teach. He is a very conscientious student who always produces quality work. His
achievement in French is among the best in the class. He had a fantastic language learning year. He can deduce meaning and
demonstrate understanding of the overall message, key points and details in a range of longer passages (including some
authentic sources, adapted or abridged). When speaking in French, he can use a wide range of less common vocabulary and
more complex grammatical structures to interact naturally, using pronunciation and intonation which would be quite well
understood by a native speaker. Xuân Khôi can write coherent longer texts on a variety of topics, containing descriptions,
narrations and personal opinions with justification, using at least three tenses. His work is mostly accurate, and the meaning is
clear. I would encourage Xuân Khôi to take the external French qualification next year, as by keeping up his good work, he is
set to be very successful at the DELF external qualification in French.

Campus Head of Secondary Mr. Samuel Boume

Executive Cluster School Director Mr. David McLaughlin
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